

**TOWN OF HOLDEN
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
BID TAB**

MANHOLE FRAMES & GRATES, AND CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE TUBING & FITTINGS
Open Bid Date: 7/8/21 at 10:00 AM

Open By (Name and signature): Luke Haberman
Witness By (Name and Signature) Isabel McCauley

Item	Unit	Ferguson Waterworks 2 Whitman Road Canton, MA 02021 (781) 828-1350			Auburn Winwater Works Co. 6A Elm St Auburn, MA 01501 (508) 721-2599		
		24" x 48" Opening	24" x 24" Opening	24" Round Opening	24" x 48" Opening	24" x 24" Opening	24" Round Opening
Precast Concrete Structures (Top Sections)							
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 1' Flat Top Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 1' Flat Top Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 1' Flat Top Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Eccentric Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Eccentric Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Precast Concrete Structures (Riser and Base Sections)							
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 4' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 4' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 4' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 4' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 1' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 4' Riser Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 2' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 3' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia. Precast Conc. Structure: 4' Base Section	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Corrugated Polyethylene Tubing & Fittings							
		Solid	Perforated	Coupling Bands	Solid	Perforated	Coupling Bands
Heavy Duty Culvert							
CPE Pipe 4"	FT	\$0.74	\$0.74	\$2.37	\$0.75	\$0.75	\$2.35
CPE Pipe 6"	FT	\$1.81	\$1.81	\$5.54	\$1.80	\$1.80	\$5.45
CPE Pipe 8"	FT	\$3.56	\$3.56	\$7.56	\$3.50	\$3.50	\$7.40
CPE Pipe 10"	FT	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$10.42	\$5.85	\$5.85	\$10.25
CPE Pipe 12"	FT	\$8.94	\$8.94	\$11.73	\$8.80	\$8.80	\$11.50
CPE Pipe 15"	FT	\$11.64	\$11.64	\$19.84	\$11.40	\$11.40	\$19.50
CPE Pipe 18"	FT	\$17.32	\$17.32	\$33.28	\$17.00	\$17.00	\$32.65
CPE Pipe 24"	FT	\$25.78	\$25.78	\$47.32	\$25.30	\$25.30	\$46.40
CPE Pipe 30"	FT	\$44.13	\$44.13	\$111.25	N/A	N/A	\$109.05
CPE Pipe 48"	FT	\$86.92	\$86.92	\$263.95	N/A	N/A	\$260.00
CPE Pipe 60"	FT	\$117.05	\$117.05	\$408.70	N/A	N/A	\$401.00
Smooth Interior							
CPE Pipe 4"	FT	\$1.60	\$1.60	\$2.37	\$1.60	\$1.60	\$2.35
CPE Pipe 6"	FT	\$3.98	\$3.98	\$5.54	\$3.90	\$3.90	\$5.45
CPE Pipe 8"	FT	\$6.76	\$6.76	\$7.56	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$7.40
CPE Pipe 10"	FT	\$9.60	\$9.60	\$10.42	\$9.40	\$9.40	\$10.25
CPE Pipe 12"	FT	\$9.46	\$9.46	\$11.73	\$9.30	\$9.30	\$11.50
CPE Pipe 15"	FT	\$12.17	\$12.17	\$19.84	\$11.95	\$11.95	\$19.50
CPE Pipe 18"	FT	\$18.24	\$18.24	\$33.28	\$17.90	\$17.90	\$32.65
CPE Pipe 24"	FT	\$27.51	\$27.51	\$47.32	\$27.00	\$27.00	\$46.40
CPE Pipe 30"	FT	\$44.13	\$44.13	\$111.25	\$43.30	\$43.30	\$109.05
Manhole Frames and Covers							
26" x 8" Manhole frame	EA		\$283.18			\$221.00	
26" Dia. Manhole Cover	EA		\$187.31			\$172.20	
26" x 8" Manhole Frame and Cover	EA		\$419.75			\$393.20	
MH Frame & Cov Marked "Sewer" 32" x 8"	EA		\$487.32			\$468.00	
Catch Basin and Manhole Adjusting Rings							
Adj. Rings MH or CB 1" x 24"	EA		\$154.02			\$122.50	
Adj. Rings MH or CB 1" x 26"	EA		\$159.80			\$117.80	
Adj. Rings MH or CB 1-1/2" x 24"	EA		\$163.65			\$127.80	
Adj. Rings MH or CB 1-1/2" x 26"	EA		\$171.35			\$129.00	
Adj. Rings MH or CB 2" x 24"	EA		\$176.35			\$133.50	
Adj. Rings MH or CB 2" x 26"	EA		\$182.90			\$140.00	
Catch Basin Frames and Grates							
24" x 24" x 8" CB Frames	EA		\$241.24			\$250.00	
24" x 24" CB Grates	EA		\$191.87			\$166.70	
24" x 24" x 8" CB Frames with Grates	EA		\$433.11			\$416.70	
Double CB Frames 3" Flange	EA		\$528.58			\$522.25	
Double CB Frames 4" Flange	EA		\$583.39			\$522.25	
24" Grates	EA		\$191.87			\$166.70	
Required Attachments:							
Cert. Tax Compliance			X			X	
Acknowledgement of Addendum			N/A			N/A	